## DESTRIBATS CAMPBELL STAUB, LLC Counsellors At Law 247 White Horse Avenue Hamilton, New Jersey 08610 (609) 585-2443

Fernandez, Lisa Marie 123 4th Street Apt. 9D

New York NY 10013

Account No:

Page: 1 07/06/2017

Account No: Invoice No:

43019-000M 53164

Estate of Doris C. Gregory

Interim Statement

## Fees

AJD Voicemail from J. Manahan re status of probate; email client re same 275.00 0.2  11/20/2014 AJD Review email and letter from J. Manahan; call client re same; draft email to client re engagement offer 275.00 1.1  11/21/2014 AJD Call from J. Manahan re status of probate 275.00 0.2  11/24/2014 AJD Calls to and from client re report of sinkhole; call J. Manahan re same 275.00 0.4  11/26/2014 AJD Review letter from counsel re sinkhole at NJ property 275.00 0.1  12/03/2014 AJD Review letter re sinkhole 275.00 0.1  12/09/2014 AJD Review letter from J. Manahan re sink hole and confirm probate time 275.00 0.2  12/23/2014 AJD File probate at surrogate's office with client 275.00 1.2  01/07/2015 AJD Review letter from J. Manahan re status of probate 275.00 0.1  02/02/2015 AJD Review email from J. Manahan re administrative status;		11/05/2014		Rate	Hours
AJD Review email and letter from J. Manahan; call client re same; draft email to client re engagement offer 275.00 1.1  11/21/2014     AJD Call from J. Manahan re status of probate 275.00 0.2  11/24/2014     AJD Calls to and from client re report of sinkhole; call J. Manahan re same 275.00 0.4  11/26/2014     AJD Review letter from counsel re sinkhole at NJ property 275.00 0.1  12/03/2014     AJD Review letter re sinkhole 275.00 0.1  12/09/2014     AJD Review letter from J. Manahan re sink hole and confirm probate time 275.00 0.2  12/23/2014     AJD File probate at surrogate's office with client 275.00 1.2  01/07/2015     AJD Review letter from J. Manahan re status of probate 275.00 0.1  02/02/2015     AJD Review email from J. Manahan re administrative status;				275.00	0.20
AJD Call from J. Manahan re status of probate 275.00 0.2  11/24/2014 AJD Calls to and from client re report of sinkhole; call J. Manahan re same 275.00 0.4  11/26/2014 AJD Review letter from counsel re sinkhole at NJ property 275.00 0.1  12/03/2014 AJD Review letter re sinkhole 275.00 0.1  12/09/2014 AJD Review letter from J. Manahan re sink hole and confirm probate time 275.00 0.2  12/23/2014 AJD File probate at surrogate's office with client 275.00 1.2  01/07/2015 AJD Review letter from J. Manahan re status of probate 275.00 0.1  02/02/2015 AJD Review email from J. Manahan re administrative status;				275.00	1.10
AJD Calls to and from client re report of sinkhole; call J. Manahan re same 275.00 0.4  11/26/2014 AJD Review letter from counsel re sinkhole at NJ property 275.00 0.1  12/03/2014 AJD Review letter re sinkhole 275.00 0.1  12/09/2014 AJD Review letter from J. Manahan re sink hole and confirm probate time 275.00 0.2  12/23/2014 AJD File probate at surrogate's office with client 275.00 1.2  01/07/2015 AJD Review letter from J. Manahan re status of probate 275.00 0.1  02/02/2015 AJD Review email from J. Monahan re administrative status;	•		Call from J. Manahan re status of probate	275.00	0.20
AJD Review letter from counsel re sinkhole at NJ property 275.00 0.1  12/03/2014 AJD Review letter re sinkhole 275.00 0.1  12/09/2014 AJD Review letter from J. Manahan re sink hole and confirm probate time 275.00 0.2  12/23/2014 AJD File probate at surrogate's office with client 275.00 1.2  01/07/2015 AJD Review letter from J. Manahan re status of probate 275.00 0.1  02/02/2015 AJD Review email from J. Monahan re administrative status;	•			275.00	0.40
AJD Review letter re sinkhole 275.00 0.1  12/09/2014 AJD Review letter from J. Manahan re sink hole and confirm probate time 275.00 0.2  12/23/2014 AJD File probate at surrogate's office with client 275.00 1.2  01/07/2015 AJD Review letter from J. Manahan re status of probate 275.00 0.1  02/02/2015 AJD Review email from J. Monahan re administrative status;	1		Review letter from counsel re sinkhole at NJ property	275.00	0.10
AJD Review letter from J. Manahan re sink hole and confirm probate time 275.00 0.2  12/23/2014 AJD File probate at surrogate's office with client 275.00 1.2  01/07/2015 AJD Review letter from J. Manahan re status of probate 275.00 0.1  02/02/2015 AJD Review email from J. Monahan re administrative status;	1		Review letter re sinkhole	275.00	0.10
AJD File probate at surrogate's office with client 275.00 1.20  01/07/2015    AJD Review letter from J. Manahan re status of probate 275.00 0.10  02/02/2015    AJD Review email from J. Monahan re administrative status;	1			275.00	0.20
AJD Review letter from J. Manahan re status of probate 275.00 0.19 02/02/2015 AJD Review email from J. Monahan re administrative status;	1		File probate at surrogate's office with client	275.00	1.20
AJD Review email from J. Monahan re administrative status;	0		Review letter from J. Manahan re status of probate	275.00	0.10
email client re same 275,00 0,20	0		Review email from J. Monahan re administrative status; email client re same	275,00	0.20

Fernand	dez, Lisa Marie	Account No:	07/06/2017 43019-000V
Estate o	of Doris C. Gregory	Invoice No:	53164
10/14/2016 11/28/2016 11/28/2016	UPS Delivery to Bernstein & Manahan UPS Cost - Delivery to Mercer County Courthouse UPS Cost - Delivery to Bernstein & Manahan, LLC		22.64 22.64 22.64
	Total Costs		180.86
	Total Current Work		39,361.11
	Payments		
05/04/2015 10/09/2015	Payment - Thank You Payment - Thank You Total Payments		-2,145.90 -3,583.10 -5,729.00
	Balance Due		\$33,632.11
	Please Remit		\$33,632.11

Page: 20